
 

Harry Potter and the Deathly Hallows is a 2010 film based on the novel of the same name by British author J.K. Rowling. It is
the seventh and final installment in the series, following Harry Potter and the Half-Blood Prince (2009) and preceding Harry
Potter and The Cursed Child (2016). The movie was released in 3D, IMAX, fast-pace projection, surround sound Dolby Atmos
in select theaters on July 15th, 2011 to mixed reviews from critics with an aggregate critic score of 53% It earned $934 million
total on a $250 million budget. As of 2012, it is the 8th highest-grossing film of all time and the third highest-grossing film of
2011. It was also nominated for two Academy Awards, Best Original Score and Best Visual Effects.The movie is the final part
of the Harry Potter series. The last installment takes place at Hogwarts Castle as Harry (Daniel Radcliffe) and his friends Ron
(Rupert Grint) and Hermione (Emma Watson) make plans to finish off Voldemort (Ralph Fiennes). Their efforts are directed to
stopping Snape's (Alan Rickman) plan to kill Harry once he is no longer needed since Draco Malfoy was killed by Voldemort.
Voldemort then invades Hogwarts, destroying everything in his way. Harry, Ron, and Hermione are then forced to abandon the
school while the battle rages on. The movie ends after Harry defeats Voldemort in a final duel by destroying all seven of his
Horcruxes. It is later revealed that everyone who Voldemort murdered will be revived, except for Harry's parents. A Hogwarts
victory celebration ensues and Hagrid (Robbie Coltrane) takes photos of the attendees with two owls that appear to be Hedwig
(Harry's owl) and her offspring (still not named). The story continues in Harry Potter and the Cursed Child more than 19 years
after Voldemort's demise. Harry and Ginny Potter (19 years after the Battle of Hogwarts) have three children: James Sirius,
Albus Severus and Lily Luna. Albus Severus is unlike his father and older brother, and is sorted into Slytherin. Harry becomes
the Head of Magical Law Enforcement; Ron works at Weasleys' Wizard Wheezes with his brother George; Hermione works at
the Ministry for Magic; Neville Longbottom serves as an Auror; Draco Malfoy has been forgiven by both Harry and Neville;
Luna Lovegood has become a famous wizarding naturalist, whose magazine dedication to finding The Crumple-Horned
Snorkack inspires her husband Rolf Scamander (son of Newt) to find it. Rictusempra; Arthur Weasley's Muggle-Worthy
Excuse; Hagrid's Dragon; Grawp; The Tales of Beedle the Bard; The Patronus Charm (Dumbledore's memory); Voldemort
(Horcruxes); Snape (Unicorn blood); Voldemort's childhood nickname, "Tom"; the Horcrux locket. Entertainment Weekly
reported that filming began on 19 February 2009, with producer David Heyman stating that the movie would be shot back-to-
back with Harry Potter and the Deathly Hallows – Part 2. David Yates was confirmed as director. Alfonso Cuarón was
considered to direct but declined due to his commitments with another project, Children of Men .
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